A1) 0V TR RV R 0 O

638896 08/22/2006 @8

P
L ‘ f lof 2R Q.00 D 2.00 DEBRA B GREEN PARK CO
[\u ee

PARK COUNTY, COLORADO

Ordinance No. 06- 5/

An ordinance of Park County, Colorado adopting the 2006 edition of the International Building
Code, the 2006 edition of the International Residemtial Code, the 2006 edition of the
International Mechanical Code, the 2006 edition of the Fuel Gas Code, and the 2001 edition of
the NFPA 58 Liquefied Petrolenm Gas Code with the fifth edition, 1998 of the LP-GAS Code
Handbook regulating and governing the conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings
and structures; by providing the standards for supplied utilities and facilities and other physical
things and conditions essential to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation
and use; and the condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use
and the demolition of such structures in the unincorporated areas of Park County, Colorado and
any jurisdiction as allowed by Intergovernmental agreement; providing for the issuance of
permits and collection of fees therefore; repealing Ordinance No. 00-3 of the unincorporated
areas of Park County and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith.

WHEREAS, Park County, Colorado possesses the authority pursuant to C.R.S. § 30-28-201, et seq. to
adopt a building code in order to regulate the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair,
moving, removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy, equipment, use, height, area and maintenance of
all building or structures in the unincorporated areas of Park County, Colorado; and

WHEREAS, copies of the 2006 International Building Code, 2006 International Residential Code,
2006 International Mechanical Code, 2006 International Fuel Gas Code, the NFPA 58 Liquefied
Petroleum Gas Code, and LP-Gas Code Handbook are available for public inspection and review in the
Park County Building Department; and

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners wishes to adopt the 2006 edition of the
International Building Code, the 2006 edition of the International Residential Code, the 2006 edition of
the International Mechanical Code, the 2006 edition of the International Fuel Gas Code, the NFPA 58
Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code, and LP-Gas Code Handbook as amended herein.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
FOR PARK COUNTY:

Section 1. There is hereby adopted by reference as the Building Code for Park County the
International Building Code, the International Residential Code, the International Mechanical Code,
the International Fuel Gas Code, 2006 Edition, as published by the International Code Council, the
NFPA 58 Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code 2001 edition as published by the National Fire Protection
Association, LP-Gas Code Handbook fifth edition, 1998 as published by the National Fire Protection
Association, Exhibit A of Ordinance No. 00-3, Exhibit B of Ordinance No. 00-3, and Exhibit C of
Ordinance No. 00-3, adopted by Park County; and subject to the following amendments:

7/26/2006 K.5. Park County Building Department © 2006 H



AMENDMENTS FOR 2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

. DELETION AND SUBSTITUTION (APPLICABILITY) Sec. 102.6 Existing structures.

Delete Sec. 102.6 in its entirety and substitute the following: The legal occupancy of any structure
existing on the date of adoption of this code shall be permitted to continue without change unless
the use or the type of occupancy of the structure is changed. If the use or occupancy changes, the
building will only be required to meet the minimum requirements of the new occupancy class.

. DELETION (DEPARTMENT OF BUILDING SAFETY) Sec. 103.3 Deputies.

Delete Sec. 103.3 the following: For the maintenance of existing properties, see the International
Property Maintenance Code.

. DELETION AND SUBSTITUTION (PERMITS) Sec. 105.1.1 Annual permit.

Delete Sec. 105.1.1 in its entirety and substitute the following: 3-Year Permit. A new
construction-building permit issued under this code shall expire 3 years from the date of issue.
After such time if the construction has not been completed and certificate of occupancy has not
been issued the permit may be renewed before expiration date for an additional year of time.

. DELETION AND SUBSTITUTION (PERMITS) Sec. 105.1.2 Annual permit records.

Delete Sec. 105.1.2 in its entirety and substitute the following: Annual permits. Exemptions from
the 3-year permit are issued for repair and alteration. Those types of permit are the following:

Mechanical
Roofing
Remodel

Decks
Alteration
Foundation
Demolition
Basement Finish
Excavation

Rl ol e

. DELETION AND SUBSTITUTION (FEES) Sec. 108.2 Schedule of permit fees.

Delete Sec. 108.2 in its entirety and substitute the following: On buildings, structures, structural
remodels, or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid as required and shall
be based on the square footage construction cost table as illustrated in the BUILDING SAFETY
JOURNAL August 2005 edition (to be updated as necessary for market cost fluctuation), attached
hereto and the 2006 International Residential Code Appendix L - Permit Fees, attached hereto.
Annual permit fees are established by the building official.

. DELETION AND SUBSTITUTION (FEES) Sec. 108.3 Building permit valuations.

Delete Sec. 108.3 in its entirety and substitute the following: The valuation for the permit is
established in accordance with the BUILDING SAFETY JOURNAL August 2005 edition — Square
Foot Construction Costs Tabie (to be updated as necessary for market cost variation), attached
hereto.

7/26/2006 K.S. Park County Building Department © 2006 -2-



7. DELETION AND SUBSTITUTION (INSPECTIONS) Section 109.
Delete Sec. 109 in its entirety and substitute the following: 109.1 General. All construction or
work for which a permit is required shall be subject to inspection by the building official and alt
such construction or work shall remain accessible and exposed for inspection purposes until
approved by the building official. In addition, certain types of construction shall have continuous
inspection.

Approval as a result of an inspection shall not be construed to be an approval of a violation of the
provisions of this code or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction. Inspections presuming to give
authority to violate or cancel the provisions of this code or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction
shall not be valid.

It shall be the duty of the permit applicant to cause the work to remain accessible and exposed for
inspection purposes. Neither the building official nor the jurisdiction shall be liable for expense
entailed in the removal or replacement of any material require to allow inspection.

A survey of the lot may be required by the building official to verify that the structure is located in
accordance with the approved plans.

109.2 Inspection Record Card. Work requiring a permit shall not be commenced until the permit
holder or an agent of the permit holder shall have posted or otherwise made available an inspection
record card such as to allow the building official to conveniently make the required entries thereon

regarding inspection of the work. This card shall be maintained available by the permit holder until
final approval has been granted by the building official. '

109.3 Inspection Requests. It shall be the duty of the person doing the work authorized by a
permit to notify the building official that such work is ready for inspection. The building official
may require that every request for inspection be filed at least two working days before such
inspection is desired. Such request may be in writing or by telephone at the option of the building
official.

It shall be the duty of the person requesting any inspections required by this code to provide access
to and means for inspection of such work.

109.4 Approval Required. Work shall not be done beyond the point indicated in each successive
inspection without first obtaining the approval of the building official. The building official, upon
notification, shall make the requested inspections and shall either indicate that portion of the
construction 1s satisfactory as completed, or shall notify the permit holder or an agent of the permit
holder wherein the same fails to comply with this code. Any portions that do not comply shall be
corrected and such portion shall not be covered or concealed until authorized by the building
official.

There shall be a final inspection and approval of all buildings and structures when completed and
ready for occupancy and use.

7/26/2006 K.S. Park County Building Department © 2006 3.




109.5 Required Inspections.

109.5.1 General. Reinforcing and steel or structural framework of any part of any building or
structure shall not be covered or concealed without first obtaining the approval of the building
official.

Protection of joints and penetrations in fire-resistive assemblies shall not be concealed from view
until inspected and approved. '

The building official, upon notification, shall make the inspections set forth in the following
sections.

109.5.2 Footing/Monolithic and Structural pad inspection. To be made after excavations for
footings and pads are complete and any required reinforcing steel is in place and before placement
of concrete.

109.5.3 Foundation wall inspection. For concrete foundations, any required forms and required
reinforcing steel shall be in place prior to inspection. All materials for the foundation shall be on
the job, except where concrete is ready mixed in accordance with approved nationally recognized
standards, the concrete need not be on the job. Where the foundation wall is to be constructed of
approved treated wood, additional inspections may be required by the building official.

109.5.4 Concrete slab or under-floor inspection. To be made after all in-slab or under-floor '
building service equipment, conduit, piping accessories and other ancillary equipment items are in
place, but before any concrete is placed or floor sheathing installed, including the sub floor.

109.5.5 Sheathing inspection. To be made after exterior walls and roof has been sheathed and
before any covering is placed over the nail patterns.

109.5.6 Frame inspection. To be made after the roof, all framing, fire blocking and bracing are in
place and all pipes, chimneys and vents are complete and the rough clectrical, plumbing, and
heating wires, pipes and ducts are approved.

109.5.7 Lath or gypsum board inspection. To be made after all lathing and gypsum board,
interior and exterior, is in place, but before any plastering is applied or before gypsum board joints
and fasteners are taped and finished.

109.5.8 Mid-roof inspection. To be made after ice and water shield, valley underlayment, and
flashing placement, but before any shingles or metal roof material installment.

109.5.9 Fire Rated Drywall inspection. To be made after the 5/8" drywall for fire protection has
been installed, but before any taping or plaster application.

109.5.10 Final inspection. To be made after finish grading and the building is completed and
ready for occupancy.

109.6 Other inspections. In addition to the called inspections specified above, the building official
may make or require other inspections of any construction work to ascertain compliance with the
provisions of this code and other laws, which are enforced by the code enforcement agency.

7/26/2006 K.S. Park County Building Department © 2006 -4 -



8. ADDITION (INSPECTIONS) Sec. 109.7 Reinspections.
Add Sec. 109.7 Reinspections. A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or
reinspection when such portion of work for which inspection is called is not complete or when
corrections called for are not made.

This section is not to be interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the first time a job is rejected for
failure to comply with the requirements of this code, but as controlling the practice of calling for
inspections before the job is ready for such inspection or reinspection.

Reinpsection fees may be assessed when the inspection record card is not posted or otherwise
available on the work site, the approved plans are not readily available to the inspector, for failure
to provide access on the date for which inspection is requested, or for deviating from plans
requiring the approval of the building official.

To obtain a reinspection, the applicant shall file an application therefore in writing on a form
furnished for that purpose and pay the reinspection fee in accordance with the fee established by the
building official.

In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of the work will
be performed until the required fees have been paid.

9. DELETION AND SUBSTITUTION (BOARD OF APPEALS) Sec. 112.1 General.
Delete Sec. 112.1 the following: There shall be and is hereby created a board of appeals. And
substitute the following: There shall be a board of appeals created when necessary.

10. ADDITION (CONTRACTORS) Sec. 116 Licensing/Registration of Contractors.
Add Sec. 116 See Resolution 96-59

11. DELETION AND SUBSTITUTION (DEFINITIONS) Sec. 502.1 HEIGHT, BUILDING.
Delete Sec. 502.1 HEIGHT, BUILDING in its entirety and substitute the following: The vertical
distance above a reference datum measured to the highest point of the coping of a flat roof or to
the deck line of a mansard roof or to the average height of the highest gable of a pitched or hipped
roof. The reference datum shall be selected by either of the following, whichever yields a greater
height of building:

1. The elevation of the highest adjoining sidewalk or ground surface within a 5-foot (1524
mm) horizontal distance of the exterior wall of the building when such sidewalk or ground
surface is not more than 10 feet (3048 mm) above lowest grade.

2. Anelevation 10 feet (3048) higher than the lowest grade when the sidewalk or ground
surface described in Item 1 is more than 10 feet (3048 mm) above lowest grade.

The height of a stepped or terraced building is the maximum height of any segment of the building.

7/26/2006 K.S. Park County Building Department © 2006 -5




AMENDMENTS FOR 2006 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE

1. DELETION AND SUBSTITUTION(APPLICABILITY) Sec. R102.7 Existing structures. |
Delete Sec. R102.7 in its entirety and substitute the following: The legal occupancy of any
structure existing on the date of adoption of this code shall be permitted to continue without change
unless the use or the type of occupancy of the structure is changed. If the use or occupancy
changes, the building will only be required to meet the minimum requirements of the new
occupancy class.

2. ADDITION (BUILDING PLANNING) Sec. R103.2.1 Wind limitations.
Add Sec. R103.2.1 the following: the basic wind speed for Park County residential structures is 110

Delete Sec. R105.5 the following: for periods not more than 180 days each.

4, ADDITION (PERMITS) Sec. R105.9 Schedule of permit fees.
Add Sec. R105.9 Schedule of permit fees. On buildings, structures, structural remodels, or
alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid as required and shall be based on
the square footage construction cost table as illustrated in the BUILDING SAFETY JOURNAL
August 2005 edition (to be updated as necessary for market cost fluctuation), attached hereto and
the 2006 International Residential Code Appendix L - Permit Fees, attached hereto. Annual permit
fees are established by the building official.

5. ADDITION (PERMITS) Sec. R105.10 Building permit valuations.
Add Sec. R105.10 Building permit valuations. The valuation for the permit is established in
accordance with the BUILDING SAFETY JOURNAL August 2005 edition — Square Foot
Construction Costs Table (to be updated as necessary for market cost variation), attached hereto.

6. DELETION AND SUBSTITUTION (INSPECTIONS) Section R109.
Delete Sec. R109 in its entirety and substitute the following: R109.1 General. All constructlon or
work for which a permit is required shall be subject to inspection by the building official and all
such construction or work shall remain accessible and exposed for inspection purposes until
approved by the building official. In addition, certain types of construction shall have continuous
inspection.

Approval as a result of an inspection shall not be construed to be an approval of a violation of the
provisions of this code or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction. Inspections presuming to give
authority to viclate or cancel the provisions of this code or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction
shall not be valid.

It shall be the duty of the permit applicant to cause the work to remain accessible and exposed for
inspection purposes. Neither the building official nor the jurisdiction shall be liable for expense
entailed in the removal or replacement of any material require to allow inspection.

A survey of the lot may be required by the building official to verify that the structure is located in
accordance with the approved plans.

|
\
|

m.p.h

3. DELETION (PERMITS) Sec. R105.5 Expiration.

7/26/2006 K.S. Park Couaty Building Department © 2006 -6-



R109.2 Inspection Record Card. Work requiring a permit shall not be commenced until the
permit holder or an agent of the permit holder shall have posted or otherwise made available an
inspection record card such as to allow the building official to conveniently make the required
entries thereon regarding inspection of the work. This card shall be maintained available by the
permit holder until final approval has been granted by the building official.

R109.3 Inspection Requests. It shall be the duty of the person doing the work authorized by a
permit to notify the building official that such work is ready for inspection. The building official
may require that every request for inspection be filed at least two working days before such
inspection is desired. Such request may be in writing or by telephone at the option of the building
official.

It shall be the duty of the person requesting any inspections requlred by this code to provide access
to and means for inspection of such work.

R109.4 Approval Required. Work shall not be done beyond the point indicated in each successive
inspection without first obtaining the approval of the building official. The building official, upon
notification, shall make the requested inspections and shall either indicate that portion of the
construction is satisfactory as completed, or shall notify the permit holder or an agent of the permit
holder wherein the same fails to comply with this code. Any portions that do not comply shall be
corrected and such portion shall not be covered or concealed until authorized by the building
official.

There shall be a final inspection and approval of all buildings and structures when completed and
ready for occupancy and use.

R109.5 Required Inspections.

R109.5.1 General. Reinforcing and steel or structural framework of any part of any building or
structure shall not be covered or concealed without first obtaining the approval of the building
official.

Protection of joints and penetrations in fire-resistive assemblies shall not be concealed from view
until inspected and approved.

The building official, upon notification, shall make the inspections set forth in the following
sections.

R109.5.2 Footing/Monolithic and Structural pad inspection. To be made after excavations for
footings and pads are complete and any required reinforcing steel is in place and before placement
of concrete.

R109.5.3 Foundation wall inspection. For concrete foundations, any required forms and required
reinforcing steel shall be in place prior to inspection. All materials for the foundation shall be on
the job, except where concrete is ready mixed in accordance with approved nationally recognized
standards, the concrete need not be on the job. Where the foundation wall is to be constructed of
approved treated wood, additional inspections may be required by the building official.

7/26/2006 K.3. Park County Building Department © 2006 -7-



R109.5.4 Concrete slab or under-floor inspection. To be made after all in-slab or under-floor
building service equipment, conduit, piping accessories and other ancillary equipment items are in
place, but before any concrete is placed or floor sheathing installed, including the sub floor.

R109.5.5 Sheathing inspection. To be made after exterior walls and roof has been sheathed and
before any covering is placed over the nail patterns.

R109.5.6 Frame inspection. To be made after the roof, all framing, fire blocking and bracing are
in place and all pipes, chimneys and vents are complete and the rough electrical, plumbing, and
heating wires, pipes and ducts are approved.

R109.5.7 Lath or gypsum boeard inspection. To be made after all lathing and gypsum board,
interior and exterior, is in place, but before any plastering is applied or before gypsum board joints
and fasteners are taped and finished.

R109.5.8 Mid-roof inspection. To be made after ice and water shield, valley underlayment, and
flashing placement, but before any shingles or metal roof material installment.

R109.5.9 Fire Rated Drywall inspection. To be made after the 5/8" drywall for fire protection has
been installed, but before any taping or plaster application.

R109.5.10 Final inspection. To be made after finish grading and the building is completed and
ready for occupancy.

R109.6 Other inspections. In addition to the called inspections specified above, the building
official may make or require other inspections of any construction work to ascertain compliance
with the provisions of this code and other laws, which are enforced by the code enforcement
agency.

7. ADDITION (INSPECTIONS) Sec. R109.7 Reinspections.
Add Sec. R109.7 Reinspections. A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or
reinspection when such portion of work for which inspection is called is not complete or when
corrections called for are not made.

This section is not to be interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the first time a job is rejected for
failure to comply with the requirements of this code, but as controlling the practice of calling for
inspections before the job is ready for such inspection or reinspection.

Reinspection fees may be assessed when the inspection record card is not posted or otherwise
available on the work site, the approved plans are not readily available to the inspector, for failure
to provide access on the date for which inspection is requested, or for deviating from plans without
obtaining a change order on the original plans.

To obtain a reinspection, the applicant shall file an application therefore in writing on a form
furnished for that purpose and pay the reinspection fee in accordance with the fee established by the
building official.

In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of the work will
be performed until the required fees have been paid.

7/26/2006 K.S. Park County Building Department © 2006 -8-

e



10

11,

12.

13.

14,

15.

i6.

7/26/2006 K8, Park County Building Department © 2006 -9-

DELETION AND SUBSTITUTION (BOARD OF APPEALS) Sec. R112.1 General.
Delete Sec. R112.1 General. the following: there shall be and is hereby created a board of appeals.
And substitute A board of appeals shall be created when needed.

DELETION AND SUBSTITUTION (DEFINITIONS) Sec. R202 HEIGHT, BUILDING.
Delete Sec. R202 HEIGHT, BUILDING in its entirety and substitute the following: The vertical
distance above a reference datum measured to the highest point of the coping of a flat roof or to the
deck line of a mansard roof or to the average height of the highest gable of a pitched or hipped roof.
The reference datum shall be selected by either of the following, whichever yields a greater height
of building:

1. The elevation of the highest adjoining sidewalk or ground surface within a 5-foot (1524
mm) horizontal distance of the exterior wall of the building when such sidewalk or ground
surface 1s not more than 10 feet (3048 mm) above lowest grade.

2. Anelevation 10 feet (3048 mm) higher than the lowest grade when the sidewalk or ground
surface described in Item 1 is more than 10 feet (3048 mm) above lowest grade.

The height of a stepped or terraced building is the maximum height of any segment of the
building.

. DELETION (DEFINITIONS) Sec. R202 MANUFACTURED HOME.

Delete Sec. R202 MANUFACTURED HOME in its entirety.

ADDITION (GLAZING) Sec. R308.4 Hazardous locations.
Add Sec. R308.4 Hazardous locations #12. Glazing within 60 inches above the plane of any
window or bench seat.

DELETION (GARAGES AND CARPORTS) Sec. R309.3 Floor Surface.
Delete Sec. R309.3 the following: to a drain or

DELETION (GARAGES AND CARPORTS) Sec. R309.4 Carports.
Delete Sec. R309.4 the following: to a drain or

DELETION (PROTECTION AGAINST DECAY) Sec. R319.1.4 Wood columns. Exceptions:
Delete Sec. R319.1.4 Exceptions 1. and 2. the following: and the earth is covered by an approved
impervious moisture barrier.

DELETION AND SUBSTITUTION (FOOTINGS) Sec. R403.1.3.1 Foundations with stem
walls,

Delete Sec. R403.1.3.1 in its entirety and substitute Foundations with stem walls shall have
installed a minimum of two No. 4 rebar 60 grade or two No. 5 rebar 40 grade within 12 (305mm}
of the top of the wall and two No. 4 rebar 60 grade or two No. 5 rebar 40 grade located 3 inches
(76mm) to 4 inches (102mm) from the bottom of the footing Figure R403.1.3.1 Suggested
Foundation Design Attached hereto.

ADDITION (FOOTINGS) Figure R403.1(1) Basement or craw] space with foundation wall
bearing directly on soil.

Add Figure R403.1(1) A soils report and engineered foundation design will be required if the
basement or crawl space wall is bearing directly on soil and no footing is present.




17.

18.

19.

20.

21.

22,

23.

24.

25.

26.

27.

28.

ADDITION (FOOTINGS) Figure R403.1(2) Permanent wood foundation basement

wall section.
Add Figure R403.1(2) All wood foundations will bear an engineer stamp on footing or gravel.

ADDITION (FOOTINGS) Figure R403.1(3) Permanent wood foundation crawl space
section.
Add Figure R403.1(3) All wood foundations will bear an engimeer starnp on footing or gravel.

DELETION (FOOTINGS) Sec R403.1.5 Slope.
Delete Sec. R403.1.5 the following The bottom surface of footings shall not have a slope
exceeding one unit vertical in 10 units horizontal (10-percent slope).

DELETION (FOUNDATION DRAINAGE) Sec R405.1 Concrete or masonry foundations.
Delete Sec. R405.1 Exception: A drainage system is not required when the foundation is installed
on well-drained ground or sand-gravel mixture soils according to the Unified Soils Classification
System, Group I Soils, as detailed in Table R405.1.

ADDITION (UNDER-FLOOR SPACE) Sec R408.1 Ventilation.
Add Sec R408.1 the following: Reduce venting to 10% (percent) of this requirement if 6 mil
plastic is used to cover soil and added as a vapor barrier.

DELETION AND ADDITION (WALL CONSTRUCTION) Table Sec. R602.3(1) Fastener
Schedule for Structural Members.

Delete Table Sec. R602.3(1) the following: all references to staples and add Note j. Staples are not
allowed as a fastener for any structural components.

DELETION AND ADDITION (WALL CONSTRUCTION) Table Sec. R602.3(2) Alternate
Attachments.

Delete Table Sec. R602.3(2) the following: all references to staples and add Note g. Staples are
not allowed as a alternate attachment.

DELETION (WOOD WALL FRAMING) Sec. R602.7.1 Wood structural panel box headers.
Delete Sec. R602.7.1 in its entirety.

DELETION (WOOD WALL FRAMING) Table R602.7.2 Maximum spans for wood
structural panel box headers.
Delete Table R602.7.2 in its entirety.

DELETION (WOOD WALL FRAMING) Figure R602.7.2 Typical wood structural panel
box header construction.
Delete Figure R602.7.2 in its entirety.

DELETION AND ADDITION (REQUIREMENTS FOR ROOF COVERINGS) Sec.
R905.2.7 Underlayment application.
All references to starting at the eaves, and substitute starting at the edge of ice barrier.

DELETION (FACTORY-BUILT FIREPLACES) Sec. R1004.4 Unvented gas log heaters.
Delete Sec. R1004.4 in its entirety.

7/26/2006 K.8. Park County Building Department © 2006 -10-




- “._r_-.\x-.-‘_\k"‘ .
Bt

- 3ors
- T
- PR

) 0 RN O AR O O 0

630896 08/22/2006 ©B:52
2eof 2R 2.88 D 0.20 DEBRA A GREEN PARK CO

29. DELETION AND SUBSTITUTION (APPLIANCE ACCESS) Sec. M1305.1.4 Appliances
under floors.
Delete Sec. M1305.1.4 in its entirety and Substitute Park County Building Department 1994
Edition Uniform Mechanical Code Interpretation dated 8/11/1999. Attached hereto.

Section 2. - Penalties. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect,
construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert or demolish, equip, use,
occupy or maintain any building or structure or cause or permit the same to be done in
violation of this Code. A person or entity who violates this Code may be fined in an amount
not to exceed one hundred dollars, or imprisoned for not more than ten (10) days, or suffer
both fine and imprisonment, in addition to other sanctions set forth in C.R.S. §§ 30-28-209
and 210, as amended.

Section 3. That Park County Ordinance No. 00-3 adopting the 1997 Uniform
Building Code and all other ordinances and resolutions or parts of ordinances and resolution
in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4. That if any section, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance is, for
any reason, held to be invalid or unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity or
constitutionality of the remaining portions of this ordinance. The Board of County
Commissioners hereby declares that it would have passed this ordinance, and each section,
clause or phrase hereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more of the sections,
sentences, clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Section 5. Pursuant to C.R.S. § 30-15-405, this ordinance shall be published in full
following its initial introduction and reading and published by title only following final adoption
by the Board of County Commissioners and shall be effective thirty (30) days following such
publication by title only.

é%@ﬁ 2006.

PARK COUNTY BOARD CF
COMMISSIONERS

Z;’ A/;’/,é

Leni Walker, Chairman

L

"y -,_,“:\ \\\\‘\cg-.. ¥

County Clerk

| certify that this ordinance was introduced and read at the July 26, 2008 public hearing of the

Board of County Commissiozrs and published The Flume on , 2008,

County Clerk

6/20/2006 K.S. Park County Building Department © 2006 -1l -



Exhibit A

Park County Snow Load Chart

Platte | Mosquito | South
Canyon | Range | Park
Elevation| K-5 K-6 K-8
6000 50 50 50
6100 50 50 50
6200 50 50 50
6300 50 50 20
6400 50 50 _ 50
5500 50 50 50
6600 50 50 S0
6700 50 50 50
6800 50 50 50
6800 50 50 50
7000 50 &0 50
7100 50 50 50
7200 50 50 50
7300 50 50 50
7400 50 50 50
7500] 50 50 50
7600 50 . 50 50
7700 50 50 50
7800 52 50 50
7900 53 50 50
8000 55 50 50
8100 57 50 50
8200| &9 51 50 _
8300, 61 51 50
8400 63 52 50
8500 65 53 50
8600 68 56 50
8700 71 59 50

Platle | Mosquito | South

Canyon | Range Park
Elevation, K-5b K-6 K-8
8800; 73 63 50
8900, 76 66 50
g000| 79 639 50
9100, 82 1 50
8200; 85 73 S0
83C0; 89 74 50
9400 92 76 50
9500 95 . /8 50
9600 88 81 52
9700; 103 85 55
9800 106 88 57
8s00| 110 82 60
10000 114 85 62
10100| 116 97 64
10200 118 99 E5
10300 118 101 &7
10400| 121 103 68
10500| 123 105 70
10600 126 107 71
10700] 130 109 73
10800 133 111 74
108900 137 113 76
11000 140 115 77
1110C 117 80
11200 118 82
11300 121 85
11400 123 87
11500 125 30




EXHIBIT B

APPENDIX TO CHAPTER 35
STRAW-BALE STRUCTURES

SECTION 3505- PURPOSE

The purpose of this appendix chapter is to establish minimum prescriptive standards of
safety for the construction of structures, which use baled straw as a load bearing or non-
load bearing material.

SECTION 3506~ SCOPE
The provisions of this chapter shall apply to all structures utilizing straw bales in the
construction of wall systems. '

SECTION 3507- DEFINITIONS
For the purpose of this chapter, certain terms are defined as follows:

STRAW is the dry stems of cereal grains left after the seed heads have been removed.
BALES are rectangular compressed blocks of straw, bound by strings or wire.

FLAKES are slabs of straw removed from an untied bale. Flakes are used to fill small
gaps between the ends of stacked bales.

LAID FLAT refers to stacking bales so that the sides with the largest cross-sectional area
are horizontal and the longest dimension of this area is parallel with the wall plane.

LAID ON-EDGE refers to stacking bales so that the sides with the largest cross-
sectional area are vertical and the longest dimension of this area is horizontal and parallel
with the wall plane,

SECTION 3508- MATERIALS

3508.1 Specifications for Bales

3508.1.1 Type of Straw. Bales of various types of straw, including, but not limited to,
wheat, rice, rye, barely, oats and similar plants, shall be acceptable if they meet the

minimum requirements for density, shape, moisture content, and ties.

3508.1.2 Shape. Bales shall be rectangular in shape.

3508.1.3 Dimensions. Bales used within a continuous wall shall be of consistent height
and width to ensure even distribution of loads within wall systems.




3508.1.4 Ties. Bales shall be bound with ties of either polypropylene string or baling
wire. Structural bales shall require three (3) ties. Nonstructural bales shall require two (2)
ties. Bales with broken or loose ties shall not be used unless the broken or loose ties are
replaced with ties restoring the original degree of compaction of the bale as computed by
a motsture and density test.

3508.1.5 Moisture Content. Moisture content of bales, at time of installation, shalf not
exceed 20% of the total weight of the bale. Moisture content of bales shall be determined
by one of the following:

3508.1.5.1 Field Method. A suitable moisture meter, designed for use with baled straw
or hay, and equipped with a probe of sufficient length to reach the center of the bale, shalt
be used to determine the average moisture content of five (5) bales randomly selected
from the bales to be used.

3508.1.5.2 Laboratory Method. A total of five (5) samples, taken from the center of
each five (5) bales randomly selected from the bales to be used, shall be tested for
moisture content by a recognized testing lab. -

3508.1.6 Density. Bales in load-bearing structures shall have minimum calculated dry
density of 7.0 pounds per cubic foot.. The calculated dry density shall be determined after
reducing the actual bale weight by the weight of the moisture content, as determined in
section 3504.1.5. The calculated dry density shall be determined by dividing the
calculated dry weight of the bale by the volume of the bale.

3508.1.7 Custom Size Bales. Where custom-made partial bales are used, they shall be of
the same density, same string or wire tension, and, where possible, use the same number
of ties as the standard size bales.

SECTION 3509- CONSTRUCTION AND GENERAL REQUIREMENTS

3509.1 General. Bale walls, when covered with plaster, drywall or stucco shall be
deemed to have the equivalent fire resistive rating as wood frame construction with the
same wall-finishing system.

3509.2 Wall Thickness. Nominal minimum bale wall thickness shall be fourteen (14)
inches.

3509.3 Wall Height. Bale walls shall not exceed one story in height and the bale portion
shall not exceed a height to width ratio of 5.6:1 (for example, the maximum height for the
bale portion of a twenty-three (23) inch thick wall would be 10 feet-8 inches), unless the
structure 1s designed by an engineer or architect licensed by the State of Colorado and
approved by the Building Official.




Exception: In the non-load bearing exterior end walls of structures with gable or
shed roofs, an approved continuous assembly shall be required at the roof bearing
assembly level.

3509.4 Unsupported Wall Length. The ratio of unsupported wall length to thickness,
for load bearing bale walls, shall not exceed 15.7:1 (for a 23 inch thick wall, the
maximum unsupported length allowed is 30 feet), unless the structure is designed by an

engineer or architect licensed by the State of Colorado and approved by the Building
Official.

3509.5 AHlowable Loads. The zllowable vertical load (live and dead load) on the top of
load-bearing bale walls shall not exceed 400 pounds per square foot (psf) and the
resultant load shall act at the center of the wall. Bale structures shall be designed to
withstand all vertical and horizortal loads as specified in Uniform Building Code Chapter
16.

3509.6 Foundations. Foundations shall be of concrete or filled masonry sized to
accommodate the thickness of the bale wall and the load created by the wall and roof live
and dead loads. Foundation (stem) walls which support bale walls shall extend to an
elevation of not less than eight (8) inches above adjacent ground at all points. The
minimum width of the footing shall be the width of the bale it supports, except that the
bales may overhang the exterior edge of the foundation by not more than three (3) inches
to accommodate rigid perimeter insulation. Footing shall extend a minimum of twelve
(12) inches below natural, undisturbed soil, or to frost line, whichever is lower.

3509.6.1 Foundation Investigation. Foundation investigation may be required by the
building official and shall be in accordance with the provisions of Section 1804.

3509.7 Wali and Roof Bearing Assembly Anchorage.

3509.7.1 General. Vertical reinforcing bars with a minimum diameter of }2"" shall be
embedded in the foundation a minimum depth of seven (7) inches, and shall extend above
foundation a minimum of % the depth of the bale. These vertical bars shall be located
along the centerline of the bale wall, spaced two (2) per bale but not closer than six (6)
inches from the bale end. A vertical bar shall also be located within 1 foot of any
opening or corner, except at locations occupied by anchor bolts.

3509.7.2 ANCHOR METHOD.

3509.7.2.1 Anchor Beolts. Anchor bolts may be substituted for reinforcing bar. Load
bearing bale walls shall be anchored to the foundation by ¥4"* diameter steel anchor boits
embedded at least seven (7) inches in the foundation at intervals of six (6) feet or less. A
minimum of two anchor bolts per wall shall be provided with one bolt located within
thirty-six (36) inches of each end of each wall. Sections of %'’ diameter threaded rod

shall be connected to the anchor bolts, and to each other, by means of threaded coupling




nuts and shall extend through the roof bearing assembly and be fastened with a properly
sized steel washer and nut, Bale walls and roof bearing assemblies may be anchored to
the foundation by means of other methods which are adequate to resist uplift forces
resulting from the design wind load. There shall be 2 minimum of two peints of
anchorage per wall, spaced not more than six (6) feet apart, with one located within
thirty-six (36) inches of each end of each wall.

3509.7.2.2 Cable and Turnbuckle. Load bearing walls shall be anchored to the.
foundation by a minimum 1/4 inch galvanized hardware quality braided cable with
turnbuckles. ‘Cables shall have the same spacing as the anchor bolt method. The cable
shall extend through the concrete footing/stem wall a minimum of three (3) inches below
the top surface. The conerete shall be protected from damage by the tensioned cable by a
sleeve inserted in the stem wall. The sleeve shall have flared ends to prevent cable
breakage. The cable shall pass up and over the 27 x 127 concrete or framed bond beam
down to the tummbuckle,

3509.7.2.3 Tensioning. Regardless of the method of anchorage, tension shall be applied

to the bale wall until fully compressed. Walls shall be re-tensioned after the walls have

been allowed to stand a minimum of twenty-four (24) hours. The dead load of the roof

and ceiling systems will produce vertical compression of the bales. Regardless of the

anchoring system used to attach the roof bearing assembly to the foundation, prior to

installation of wall finish materials, bolts or straps shall be re-tightened to compensate for
this compressiomn.

3509.7.2 Intersecting Walls. Walls of other materials intersecting bale walls shall be
attached to" the bale wall by means of one or more of the following methods or an
acceptable equivalent:

1. Number four {4) rebar or wooden dowels at least 5/8"7 in diameter of
sufficient length to provide twelve (12) inches of penetration into the bale,
driven through holes bored in the abutting stud, and spaced to provide one
dowel connection per bale.

2. Pointed'wooden stakes, at least twelve (12) inches I in length and 1 4" by 3-14"
at the exposed end, fully driven into each course of bales, as anchorage points.

3. RBolted or threaded rod connection of the abutting wall, through the bale wall,
to a steel'nut and steel or plywood plate washer a minimum of six (6) mches
square and 2 minimum thickness of 3/16”" for steel and 4" for plywood, in at
least three locations. ' ’

3509.7.4 Moisture Barrier. A moisture barrier shall be used between the top of the
foundation and the bottom of the bale wall to prevent moisture from migrating through
the foundation into the bottom course bales. This barrier shall consist of one of the
foliowing: . -

1. cementitious Waterproof coating, _

2. type 30 asphalt felt over an asphalt emulsion;

3. sheet metal flashing, sealed at the jcints;

4. 6 mil poly-vinyl sheeting




SECTION 3510 LOAD BEARING WALLS

'3510.1 Stacking and Pinning. Bales in load-bearing walls shali be laid flat and stacked
in running bond where possible, with each bale overlapping the two bales beneath it
Overlaps shall be a minimum of twelve (12} inches. Gaps between the ends of bales,
which are less than six (6) inches in width, can be filled by an untied flake inserted
snugly into the gap. Gaps greater than six (6) inches in width shall be filled with properly
sized, compressed bales. '

The first course of bales shall be laid by impaling the bales cn the vertical bars or
threaded rods; extending from the foundation. When the fourth course has been laid, #4
rebar pins, or an acceptable equivalent, long enough to extend through all four (4)
courses, shall be driven down through the bales, two (2) in each bale, located so that they
do not pass within six (6) inches of, or through the space between the ends of any two (2)
bales. The layout of these pins shall approximate the layout of the vertical bars extending
fom the foundation. As‘each subsequent course is laid, two (2) pins, long enough to
extend through the course being laid and the three (3) courses immediately below it, shall
be driven down ilirough each bale. This pinning method shall be continued to the top of
the wall, : ‘ ' .
Ounly full-length bales shall be used at comers of load bearing walls, unless designed by
an engineer or architect licensed by the State of Colorado, and 'approved by the Building
Official. R ' o '

Vertical #4 rebar pins, or an acceptable alternative, shall be located within one (1) foot.of
all corners, window and door openings. An additional pin shall be added if the layout of
pins does not fall within twelve (12) inches of openings or comers.

Staples, made of #3 or larger rebar formed into a “U” shape, at least eighteen (18) inches
long with two six (6) inch legs, shall be used at all corners of every course, driven with
one leg into the top of each abutting corner bale. In liew of staples, corner bales may be
tied together by a method approved by the building official.

3510.2 Alternate pinning method. When the third course has been laid, vertical #4
rebar pins, or an acceptable equivalent, long enough to extend through all three (3)
courses, shall be driven down through the bales, two in each bale, located so that they do
not pass within six (€) inches of, or through, the space between the ends of any two bales.
The layout of these rebar pins shall approximate the layout of the rebar pins extending
from the foundation. As each subsequent course is laid, two (2) such pins, long enough
to extend through that course and the two (2) courses immediately below, shall be driven
down through each.bale. This pinning method shail be continued to the top of the wall

SECTION 3511 NON-LOAD BEARING WALLS




T,

3511.1 Stacking and Pinning. Bales in non-foad bearing walls may be laid either flat or
on-edge and stacked in running bond where possible. For non-load bearing walls, bales
may be laid either flat or on-edge. Overlaps shall be a minimum of twelve (12) inches.
Gaps between the ends of bales, which are less than six (6) inches in width, can be filled
by an untied flake inserted snugly into the gap. Gaps greater than six (6} inches in width
shall be filled with properly sized, compressed bales.

The first course of bales shall be laid by impaling the bales on the vertical bars or
threaded rods, if any, extending from the foundation. When the fourth course has been
laid, #4.rebar pins, or an acceptable equivalent, long enough to extend through all four (4)
courses, shall be driven down through the bales, two (2) in each bale, located so that they
do not pass within six (6) inches of| or through the space between the ends of any two (2)
bales. The layout of these pins shall approximate the layout of the vertical bars extending
from the foundation. As each subsequent course is laid, two (2) pins, long enough to
extend through the course being laid and the three (3) courses immediately below it, shali
be driven down through each bale. This pinning method shall be continued to the top of
the wall.

Vertical #4 rebar pins, or an acceptable alternative, shall be located within one (1) foot of
all window and door openings. An additional pin shall be added if the layout of pins does
not fall within twelve (12) inches of openings.

3511.2 Alternate pinning method. When the third course has been laid, vertical #4
rebar pins, or an acceptable equivalent, long enough to extend through all three (3)
courses, shall be driven down through the bales, two (2) in each bale, located so that they
do not pass within six (6) inches of, or through, the space between the ends of any two (2)
bales. The layout of these rebar pins shall be approximate the layout of the rebar pins
extending from the foundation. As each subsequent course is laid, two (2} such pins,
long enough to extend through that course and the two (2) courses immediately below it,
shall be driven down through each bale. This pinning method shall be continued to the
top of the wall.

SECTION 3512 ROOF BEARING ASSEMBLY.

3512.1 General. Load bearing bale walls shall have a roof bearing assembly at the top of
the wall to bear the roof load and to provide a means of connecting the roof structure to
the foundation. The roof bearing assembly shall be continuous along the tops of exterior
and structural walls.

3512.2 Wood Frame Assembly. The roof bearing assembly shall consists of a minimum
of two double 2°'x 6°°, or larger, horizontal top plates, one located at the inner edge of the
wall and the other at the outer edge. Connecting the two doubled top plates and located
horizontally and perpendicular to the length of the wall shall be 2"'x 67 cross members
spaced no more than seventy-two (72} inches center to center, and as required to align
with the threaded rods extending from the anchor bolts in the foundation. The double
2°'x 6" top plates shall be face nailed with four (4) 16d nails staggered at sixteen (16)




inches on center. End joints in double top plates shall be offset a minimum of forty-eight
(48) inches, The cross members shall be face nailed to the top plates with four (4) 16d
nails at each end. Comer connections shall include overlaps nailed with four (4) 16d
nails or may be tied together with a minimum 57x 6” 20 gage galvanized steel plate. The
steel connector shall be nailed to each top plate with six (6) 8d nails. The connection of
roof framing members to the roof bearing assembly shall comply with the appropriate
sections of the Uniform Building Code.

3512.3 Concrete Assembly. A concrete roof bearing assembly shall consist of a
permanent concrete form of pressure treated lumber. The bottom plate shall be a
minimum 27 x 12” with minimum 2” x 8” sides and top. The 2” x 127 shall be held in
place by the #4 rebar pins used to anchor the bales and shall extend into the concrete
bond beam a minimum of five (5) inches. The top 2” X 8” may be held in place by
driving 16d galvanized nails part way into the 2” x 8” and placing the 2” x 8" nails down
into the concrete. Concrete bond beam shall be a minimum 2500-psi compressive
strength with a minimum of two (2) #4 horizontal rebar. Rebar shall be continuous at the
corners with lap splices of at least twenty-four (24) inches.

SECTION 3513 OPENINGS AND LINTELS

3513.1 Openings. All openings in bale walls shall be a minimum of one full bale length
from any outside corner. Openings in exterior bale walls shall not exceed fifty (50}
percent of the total wall area, based on interior dimensions.

3513.2 Lintels. Wall and/or roof load present above any opening shall be carried, or
transferred to the bales below by one of the following:

1. For openings two (2) feet in width or less: a structural frame, consisting of
double 2" x 12” trimmers supporting double 2” x 12” laid flat. Trimmers shall
extend to the footing.

2. For openings greater than two (2) feet in width: a lintel (such as an angle-iron
cradle, wooden beam, wooden box beam) shall be provided. Lintels shall be at
least twice as long as the opening is wide with a minimum bearing surface of
5 1/2 inches and extend twenty-four (24) inches beyond either side of the
opening. Lintels bearing surface shall be centered in the width of the bale
over openings and shall extend a minimum of one (1) full bale length on each
side. Lintels shall not exceed the load limitations of section 3505.5.

SECTION 3514 MOISTURE PROTECTION

3514 Moisture Protection. All weather-exposed bale walls shall be protected from water
damage. An approved building moisture barrier shall be used to protect at least the
bottom course of bales, but not more than the lower one-third of the vertical exterior wall
surface, in order to allow natural transpiration of moisture from the bales. The moisture
barrier shall have its upper edge inserted at least six (6) inches in to the horizontal joint
between two (2) courses of bales, and shall extend at least three (3) inches below the top

7




of the foundation. Bale walls shail have special moisture protection provided at all
windowsills. Exposed. windowsills shall provide positive drainage to prevent moisture
accumulation. A moisture barrier shail be provided on the exterior top bale for not less
than /2 the height of the bale and not more than the full bale height. Straw bale structures
shall have a minimum roof overhang of twenty-four (24) inches measured from the
exterior wall surface. Moisture protection shall consist of a waterproof membrane, such
as asphalt-impregnated feit paper, 6-mil polyethylene sheeting, or other acceptable
moisture barrier, installed in such manner as to prevent water fom entering the wall
system at window sills or at the top of walls.

SECTION 3515 WALL FINISHES

3515 Wall Finishes. Interior and exterior surfaces of bale walls shall be protected from
mechanical damage, flame, animals, and prolonged exposure to water. A moisture
barrier shall protect bale walls adjacent to bath and shower enclosures.

Cement stucco shall be reinforced with galvanized woven wire stucco netting or an
acceptable equivalent. Such reinforcement shall be secured by attachment through the
wall at a maximum spacing of twenty-four (24) inches horizontally and sixteen (16)
inches vertically. Fasteners shall be staples of #8 wire gage a minimum of twelve (12)
inches long inserted at alternating angles to prevent pullout.

Where bales abut other materials the plaster/stucco shall be reinforced with galvanized
expanded metal lath, or an acceptable equivalent, extending a minimum of six (6) inches
onto the bales.

Earthen and lime-based plasters may be applied directly onto the exterior and interior
surface of bale walls without reinforcement, except where applied over materials other
than straw. Weather-exposed earthen plasters shall be stabilized using a method
approved by the building official.




| Exhibit G
Appendix to Chapter 35

EARTHSHIP STRUCTURES

SECTION 3514 : PURPOSE

The purpose of this appendix is to establish standards of safety for special construciion
of structures made of rammed earth tire walls, or "earthship structures”. This appendix
is to be uséd in conjunction with the adopted building codes applicabie o conventional

construction practices.
SECT!ON 35141 SCOPE -

The provrsrons of thrs appendlx shall apply: to all bearing, part tlon freestandmg and
rétaining walls constructed of rammed earth tires. Footings for wa[ls constructed of

concrete wrth atummum cans are aiso addressed.

SECTION 3514 2 TIRE SIZES USED IN BEARING AND RETA!N[NG WALLS

As referenced in this appendrx permissible automobile tires used in bear ng or reta nmg
Walls shall be no less than 13-inch radius, as specified herein t

SECTION 3514 3 T!RE WALLS FOUNDATION

A properly constructed tire wall is considered a monclith foundation provrded it meets
the following: criferia: - :

1. The first course of tires of any tire wall must be leveled and dug one foot (1’ )into
unpdisturbed soil free of organrc surface matter such as piants tree roots or other”-

' biodegradab[e substances

2. The frst course of trres must be as large in drameter or larger in diameter than
any other tire in the wall. No tire may appear in a wall that is larger in diameter
than the tires on the ground course of that wall.

SECTION 35144 COURSING
1. A!t tire wa[ts must use staggered running bond coursrng

2. Jomts between trres cn any given course must be ali gned with the central area of
ai! fires on courses above and below. No joint between tires on any given course

may align with any joint on the courses above or below.

3. Half-tire techniques as outfined in Sectlon 3514.6 must be USed to maintain
runn ing bond coursing.
M




SECTION 3514.5 CONCRETE HALF-TIRE TECHNIQUES

1.

C'pncrete half-tires rmust use a mix of 3 parts cement, 4 parts sand, 5 parts gravel
with engineering fibers. All tires adjacent to concrete half blocks must be
porcupined with 16d galvanizéd nails to lock concrete (o tires.

All two story tire walil applications must use concrete half-tires and be designed -
by a Colorado licensed architect or structural engineer.

SECTIQN 3514.6 RAMMED EARTH HALF-TIRES

1.

Rammed earth half-tires are made by cutting a piece of wire lath” or mesh,
approximately the width of-the tire tread, in half and leaving tabs on the sides to
screw into the adjacent fire. - This haif-tire is then pounded like a regular fire.
Rammed earth half-tires may be used only in tire walls five courses high or less. :

Ramimed earth haif-tires shall not be used at the end of a building wall or at the
end of any type of bearirig wall. " ' T TS G

SECTION 35147 BEARING WALLS -

1.

1.

Bearing Wa}ls".r built from rammed earth automobile fire casings shall conform to.
the fO”OMngSpeoiﬁcationsr S A
(a‘.)' All bearing walis buiit from rammed carth automobile tire casings must

have a continuous bond beam of wood or concrete as specified in Section

351411 .

(-;b') All beari';l;c:; Waf[s'eight'-co.urées"or higher, built-from rammed earth

. automokile tire casings, must have a continuous bond beam:that.connetts . -

to a continuous bond beam on adjacent non-bearing tire walls. . See
Section 3514.11:for bond beam spet;iﬁc_ations. Héight'requirements' are"

specified in Section 3514.14.

"SECTION 3514.8 RETAINING WALLS built with rammed earth auto_niobile fires
shall be constructed to meet the requirements of this Section ds

‘well as Section 35147,

All retaining walls built’ from. rammed earth autormobileé tire casings ‘must be

~ stepped back (battered; i.e, lean into the earth they are retaining) 27 per course
minimurm. ' LT T - 7

All retaining walls more 'thén- ten {(10) feetin height must be_‘desi'gh'ed by a

Colorado registered architect or structural engineer.

)




SECTION 3514.9 FREESTANDING WALLS

Any wall not tied into the roof structure of a building is considered a freestanding wall
which shall be constructed in conformance with the requiresments of this Section.

1. All freestanding walls over 2 cOUrses high built from rammed earth automobile
it into the design of the wall.

tire casings must have continuocus arcs  bui
Freestanding walls cannot be straight for any distance.

2. Freestanding walls built of rammed earth automobile tire casings shall not
exceed 5 courses in height unless specifications and construction drawings for
such wall, designed and certified by a Colorado licensed architect or engineer
are provided to and approved by the Building Official. ‘ o

SECTION 3514.10 CANWALLS

Car walls aré walls constructed of atuminum cans and concrete. Aluminum cans are
placed in the wall in a vertical position with the top and hotiom of the cans facing the
f5céof the wall. The cans act as spacers and as insulation in the wall. Footings below
single can walls shall extend 3’ cither side of the wall width. Footings below double can ©
walls shall extend 3" either side of the wall width. Footings must rest one foot (1) below

undisturbed soll.
| SECTION 351411 PLATES AND BOND BEAMS

1. All tire walls that are an integral part of a roofed building shall have a continuous
wood or concrete bond beam. A wooden bond beam shall be anchored to the
tire wall with %" anchor bolts set 7" minimum depth in concrete every other tire or

14" rebar driven down through three courses of tires and bent over the top of the

wood plate or set in the concrete bond beam.

2. Wood bond beam plates 'shall be no less than (2) 2°x12” dimensional lumber.
Wood bond beam plates can be made up of (2) 2" x 127 s-with B-mil -plastic
hetween the rammed earth tire wall and the wood bond beam plate. The bottom
bond beam:plate must be treated lumber. Joints in the lower layer of lumber
shali never be closer than four feet {4") from joints in the upper layer of lumber.
Upper and lower fayers .of lumber <hall be laminafed with (6) 16d nails per
renning foot (On Center 127). : - .

3. Concrete bond beams shall be a minimum of 8" deep x &' wide -and have two
pisces of %4" rebar continuous. The concrete bond beam shall be thickened to
sixteen inches (16") at every tire stack, with 8" for the beam and 8" into the tire-
siack. The thickened part of the bond beam shall extend a minimum of 2" under

the bead of tire;
(3




SECTION 3514.12 OPENING IN WALLS

1. All openings in wall'srmade of rammed earth automoebile tires shall have concrete
half blocks on either side of the openings. ‘ ;

2. The wood or concrete bend beam spanning the opening shall be increased in
thickness by a minimum of eight inches (8"). = This additional thickness shall
extend on either side of the opening a minimum of four (4) feet and shall be
anchored to a concrete bearing block equivalent in thickness to the tire coursing

height.
SECTION 3514.13- MULTI-STORY

1. No multi-story earth rammed tire structure shall be constructed unless
specifications and construction drawings, designed and- certified by ‘a-Colorado
licensed architect or structural engineer are provided to and approved by the

Building Official. | | I
SECTION 3514.14 HEIGHT OF TIREWALLS -
1. The maximum height for a straight ‘earth rammed tire:wall is ten (10} feet,

Straight tire walls shall be bermed to the top of the top course of tires for support.
The use of a straight tire wall for-any distance is not recommended they are not

stable. ' .
2. The maximum ‘hei-gh't for a clrved (arched) rammed earth tire wall is twelve (12)
feetl ' o ' S :
3. The maximum height for a nén-struct‘ural, freestanding Wéfl (e.g.,z 6ou_rtya'rd wall)

that is not curved or battered.is six (6) feet.
SECTION 3514.15 LOADING OF WALLS

1. .Lo'éding'én;éa'rtﬁrarhmed tire walls must be distributed lcading o’hly from joists,
beams or rafters resting ocn @ cpntinu’ous-w’ood'Or'conorete bond beam..
2. No point or céliécted lééding' is. permitted ‘on earth rammed tire .'watls unless

special engineering, as approved by the Building Official, - is. provided. by a
Colorado Iicensedengjintaer or architect. '

SECTION 3514.16 -FILL OF WALLS

1. All tire casings must be packed with at least: Q0% earth materials. Soft spongy
tire packing is not acceptabie. Properly compacted tires should have a domed
bulge to the tire wall.

' (4)




SECTION 3514.17 VOID FILLING

1.

All voids between tires in earth rammed tire interior walls must be packed solid
with mud in a four coat procedure, using mud mixed half and half with coarse
sand and thickened with chopped straw. Each layer of mud must be allowed fo
dry before adding the next coat of mud. The surface of the dried layer of mud
must be wetted before adding the next coat of mud. Two aluminum cans may be
used as spacers in each coat of mud. The voids must be filled untit they are
even with the surface of the tire tread. In cerfain conditions, as approved by the
Building Official, including but not limited fo instances in which a rammed earth
tire wall is unstabie, filiing voids between earth rammed tires may be
accomplished with concrete. Concrete packing might be employed if the stability
of the wall were in quéstion, whether it be from imposed loads or for any other

~ type of structural deficit.

SECTION 3514.18 EARTH CLIFFS

1.

Where rammed earth tire wails are constructed on a “stepped” or multi-level
surface (thereby creating earth ““cliffs”), a soil investigation and structural )
engineering report(s), acceptable to the Building Official, shall be submitted along
with the application for permit. Such soil investigation and structural engineering
report(s) shail indicate that the soil underlying and supporting the rammed earth
tire wall that is resting on the earth “ciiff’, is capable of supporting the tire wall,
Subject to compliance with subsection (1) of Section 3514.18 (above), earth cliffs
shall be permitted only under non-bearing rammed earth tire walls or walls only

toaded from one side such as east or west end walls:

SECTION 3514.19 JOINTS

1.

All joints and connections in rammed earth fire walls must be designed and
assembled in such a way so that no voids occur within the rammed earth tire
wall. These voids must be filled ‘with concrete or c0% compacted earth
contained in a double layer of metal lath or a rubber tire casing. ‘

All joints and connections in rammed earth tire walls must employ . overlapped
tires and joining methods so as not to resuit in stacked joints occurring over each

other. .

SECTION 3514.20 ROOF SHEATHING

1.

Roof sheathing will be a minimum of 5/8".

(5)




TOTAL VALUATION
$1t0 $ 300

$501 to $2,000
$2,001 to $40,000
$40,001 to $100,000
$100,001 to $500,000
$500,001 to $1,000,000
$1,000,001 to $5,000,000

35,000,001 and over

2006 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE®

APPENDIX L
PERMIT FEES

FEE
$24

$24 for the first $500; plus $3 for each additional $ 100 or fracton
thereof, to and including $2,000

$69 for the first $2,000; plus $11 for each additional $1,000 or
fraction thereof, to and including $40,000

$487 for the first $40,000; plus $9 for each additional $1,000 or
fraction thereof; to and including $1C0,000

$1,027 for the ﬁrst $100,000; phus $7 for each additonal $1,000 or
fraction thereof, to and including $500,000

$3,827 for the first $500,000; plus $5 £r each additional $1,000 or
fraction thereof, to and inchuding $1,000,000

. $6,327 for the first $1,000,000; plus $3 for each additional $1,000

or fractien thereof, to and including $5,000,000

$12,327 for the first $ 5,000,000 plizs $1 for each additional $1,000
or fraction thereof .

6523




Square Fopt Co nstruc:tmn Cos’cs

a, b, e

Type of Constuction

[Growp {2003 lemational Bunldmg Code] . - . i
1A 'IB. . A ns A [hz] v VA VB
A-i As'sembly, theaters, with s‘ta'ge . 17844 17270 (6858 161,74 150.3% 14960 ° 15663 13934 1343z
- Assembly thBAfEr§, without stage 16458 158.84-  154:82  147.88. 13654 -+ 13575 14278 12549 . 12047
A2 Assembly, HighfEuSs 13525 13105 12775 12277 113.88  113.69 118,50 10478 10125 |
A2 Assembly, reSfhurants, balrs, banquet halis, 184.25 . i80.06 14575 12177 - 111.99  112.69 117.56 10278 10025 .
A3 Assembiy, churches . 16534  158.60 . 155,57 148.63 13727 18648 143.53 19622 Y3120
A-3 | Assembly, general, cemmumiy halls, 136838 13114 126012 12018  107.80 10B.01 11507 9675  .52.73
- libraries, muselims’ . ' .. Lo 5 L - . - ) .
A4 Assembly, arenas - 33425 T{sdob - 198F5 12177 4199 11769 11750 1027 10025 |
8 Business ‘ _ 137.58, 713260 12688 12037 * 10957 108.89 117.69 97.85 94.08 .
E  Educafonal _ ) 146.24 {4128 13723 183112 12400 T1iB.13 i26.83 _ 108.07  103.95
|B-1__ Facfory and industrial, moderate hazard 8352  jus8] 7500, 7265 B52B4 . 63.84 69,68 5359. - 50.83
-2 Factdry-and industial, low hazard | B2.52 78.68 75007 7185 6284  62.84 | 68.68 53,59 49.83
H-1.  High Hazard, explosives 78.36 7452 704 ' B7.49. | 5385 . 5B.8% 64.52 43,60 NP
H234. High Hazdrd , - 78.38 74.52 7G84 G749 5885 S8R5 G452 .. 4360 4584
H-5  HPM . ' . 137.58 {3260 - 198138 12237 _ 108.57 108.88 11769 g7.85 94.08
G mstitutional, supervised emvironment 135.68 . 13101~ 12753 12289 11235  112.31 121.55- 403.36 899:26
412 inwfutional, incapacitated - 22889 - 22401 219 .78 . - 213.78 200.51, FLP. 20910 18879 NP,
'3 Instituional, testrained -+ -, 156.30 . 151.32 . 1431.09 12952 127.84 13641 11780 1i2.08.
4 inStiRitional, dayi care facilifies - 18583 131.01 . 122.88 11235 11231 121.55. - 103.36 99.26
M Mercantie : . - 10071, 9853 8221 - 8B24 7888 .- 7968 83.97 638.77 67.24
R-1 . Rasidenfial, hotels - {3598 131:37 12789 12275 11280 11276 . 122.00  103.8% 99.71
8-2  Residential, multiple family i © 11410, 10948 10500 {0086 - 91.02  90.98  100.22 203 | 77.93
R-3 Residential, one- and twofamily - 10941 10841 10379 100.98 86,28 95.06 99.22 91.74 86.27
R4 . Residential_care/assisted living-faciliies. - 13563 - 131201 - — 48758~ 122:3G - ~112:85 -~ 11231 — 121555 10336~ - 9826~
1S-1  Storage, modemte hazard . 7736 C 7352 6BB4 66.49 56.85 . 57.85 53.52 47600 44.8%
S-2  SYage, lowhazard | ' 7 7835 - 7252  .BB.B4 - 6549 °‘ 5885  56.85 G252 4760 43.84
Ly Utility; m?séeflafneous o 58.94 55.73 5242 49.80 4318 43.19- 4700 . 3551 33.81

&, Privale Garages use Utmiy miscellansous
. b. Unfinished basemeris (aI] use group) = $15 00 per sq. ff
T & NP =Thot permitted,

&8 Building Sofety- Journol Auéusf 2005

T‘ 6& ﬁ?&u:&wnﬂ EuB«/ 7'7%420




FIGURE R403.1.3.1 SUGGESTED FOUNDATION DESIGN
FOR CONCRETE POURED FOUNDATION WALL IN WOOD, METAL OR FOAM BLOCK
| FORMS

(We recommend a soils investigation for all foundations) -

REINFORCEMENT
SCHEDULE
WALL HEIGHT|. VERTICAL HORIZONTAL
<6 48" 0.C. 24" O.C.
<§g 24" Q.C. 24" O.C.
< 10" 16"0O.C. . 16" O.C.
<12 12" O.C. 12" O.C.

, 77 X 107 ANCHOR BOLT
T.0.W. VARIES SEE PLAN 6’ O.C. AND WITHIN 12” OF

8" ANY CORNER OR SPLICE
LT '

GROUNDING ELECTRODE~ T i
Cud . 6” MIN
3 #4 TOP & BOTTOM TYP. " | -
1 %4” FROM FORM BOARDS \SLOPE AWAY FROM FNDTN
oA 6” WITHIN 10° MINIMUM
VERTICAL STEEL (5% SLOPE)
#1@48°0C.______ 117
OR AS PER | . HORIZONTAL STEEL AS PER
REINFORCEMNT SCHEDULE
SCHEDULE Y 4
#4 DOWELS AT 48” O.C.
VERTICAL (TYP)
LAP VERTICAL STEEL” /
24> TODOWELS / #4 CONTINUOUS TYP.
Jd 1. LAPPED 18" AT SPLICES MIN.
GROUNDING ELECTRODET { /3”7 ABOVE SOIL, 1 %” FROM
{(No soil contact with | /| . FORM BOARDS
footer grounding rebar) -
8” | Q_ 4” PERFORATED
: | " DRAIN PIPE
S ———— — AS REQUIRED BY SITE
= 16”  BEDDED ON 2” % GRAVEL

COVERED BY 6” WASHED GRAVEL
STEEL IS TO BE #4 60 GRADE OR #5 40 GRADE

Note: A list of engineers is available on request




Park Ceunty Building Department
1994 Edition Uniform Mechanical Code Interpretatlon

August 11,1999 -

Section 304.6

Liquefied Petroleum Gas Appliances shall be allowed in a crawlspace when mstalled
vnder the following provzsmns

L

2.

[¥5}

Equipment shall be placed on a concrete slab. .

The slab shall contain a minimum 4-inch drain to dayllght The drain shall be

screened to prevent blockage.

The slab shall have a.curb of no 1ess than 8 mches on the three sides not adjacent
to the door opening. :

The slab and equlpment shall be located on an exterior Wall The slab shall be at

. the same level as the concrete footmg

An access door Df noﬂ'ess than 3‘O—inches_ by 30-inches shall be installed in thei

exterior wall. The dodr opening shall be t grade.

A minimum of 12-inches clearance is required on all sides of the equipment
except the front, which shall have 4 minimum of 30-inches clearance.

Equipment shall be equipped with a.n LP Gas detector located within 6-inches of .
the top of the concrete slab. The detector shall be oonnected in such a manner as'

to shut off the gas supply When the alarm sounds: -

Tgnifion sources shall be a minimumi of 12 mohes above the top of the concrete
slab '

The ¢raw! space area shall be oraded such that the lowest pomt is the opening in
the exterior wall. :

SEE DIAGRAM
_ OVER _




B\&%\Q p\,\
\.{_3& QJ

\\d 3 W_.L..j )

Urws
¢ . A

e = e

@e\% J:% qfu@ugsm
bayof 0 Uy A0, orf
. PR eW o Ne wu_,mrQ.

CESQEE \Eﬁp& __ hli\
S i

-..mm_....,‘:_\uméa:r () WL

badf 11 LA | X A @TJW
sy, 9 ¥etsalad

B 3\_.%.3 RN 1\\\%

[Uppp

-1




